Bid Tabulation

ITB 49-21 "Bottled Water, Cups and Cooler Rental”
Ericka Andrew, Buyer

Email: andrewe@jccal.org

1 2 3
DS Services of America dba Primo Water North American Water Way Distributing Company Birmingham Coca-Cola Bottling Co.
Grand Total: $ 60.58 | $ 68.25 | $ 82.73
Item L . Product L Product .
No.- Description Mfg. Product No.: Pricing Mfg. No.- Pricing Mfg. No.- Pricing
1 Distilled Water 3 gallons Crystal Springs 13003027 $ 4.25 NO BID NOBID $ - NO BID NOBID $ -
2 Natural Spring Water 3 gallons Crystal Springs 13003024  $ 4.25 Water Way 00110 $ 5.10 NO BID NOBID $ -
3 Filter Water 3 gallons NO BID $ - NO BID NOBID $ - NO BID NOBID $ -
4 Purified Water 3 gallons Crystal Springs 13003022  $ 4.25 NO BID NOBID $ - NO BID NOBID $ -
Monthly Cooler Rental (Standard Sized
Capable of Holding 3 gallons Water Nexus or similar top load coolers ~ Multiple Item
5  Container) Codes $ 2.99 |Hot/Cold Primo/Brio - No Charge 00625 $ - NO BID NOBID §$ -
Group | Total: $ 15.74 $ 5.10 $ =
Item _— . Product . Product -
No.: Description Mfg. Product No.: Pricing Mfg. No.: Pricing Mfg. No.: Pricing
1 Distilled Water 5 gallons Crystal Springs 13002021  $ 4.75 Water Way 00103 $ 5.10 NO BID NOBID $ -
2 Natural Spring Water 5 gallons Crystal Springs 13005021 $ 4.75 Water Way 00101 $ 5.10 NO BID NOBID $ -
3 Filter Water 5 gallons NO BID NO BID $ - Water Way 00102 $ 5.10 NO BID NOBID $ -
4 Purified Water 5 gallons Crystal Springs 13008021 $ 4.75 Water Way 00104 $ 5.10 NO BID NOBID $ -
Monthly Cooler Rental (Standard Sized
Capable of Holding 5 gallons Water Nexus or similar top load coolers ~ Multiple Item
5  Container) Codes 2.99(Hot/Cold Primo/Brio - No Charge 00625 $ - NO BID NOBID $ -
Group Il Total: $  17.24 $ 20.40 $ =
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1 2 3
DS Services of America dba Primo Water North American Water Way Distributing Company Birmingham Coca-Cola Bottling Co.
Il\tl(:)r.]j Description Mfg. Product No.: Pricing Mfg. Pﬁg}?a Pricing Mfg. Pr’\?gfa Pricing
1 Bottled Spring Water, 10 oz. NO BID NO BID $ - Water Way 00155 $ 4.25 NO BID NOBID $ -
2 Bottled Spring Water, 16.9 oz. Crystal Springs 130031721  $ 5.99 Water Way 00159 $ 4.25 NO BID NOBID $ -
3 Bottled Spring Water 20 oz. NO BID NO BID $ - Water Way 00162 $ 6.25 NO BID NOBID $ -
4 Bottled Purified Water 10 oz. Crystal Springs 13112410 $ 5.49 NO BID NOBID $ - NO BID NOBID $ -
5  Bottled Purified Water 16.9. Crystal Springs 13113174  $ 5.49 Water Way 00156 $ 4.25 Dasani 116366 $ 5.01
6 Bottled Purified Water 20 oz. NO BID NO BID $ - NO BID NOBID $ - Dasani 112259 $ 15.50
7 Bottled Distilled Water 20 oz. NO BID NO BID $ - NO BID NOBID $ - SmartWater 129254  $ 19.62
Group Il Total: $  16.97 $ 19.00 $ 40.13
I,\tlim Description Mfg. Product No.: Pricing Mfg. Pr'ggL_th Pricing Mfg. Pr,\cl)(c)il{ct Pricing
1 Paper Cone Cups, 5 oz. Dart/Solo = 600 cups 20225003 % 3.65 Solo 00400 $ 4.00 NO BID NOBID $ -
2 Plastic Cups, Flat Bottom 7 oz. GR Plas = 1400 cups 20260036 $ 3.29 Netchoice 00425 $ 4.00 NO BID NOBID $ -
3 Styrofoam, Cups 8 oz. Dart/Solo = 100 cups 20250014 % 0.89 Dart 00428 % 5.25 NO BID NOBID $ -
4 Styrofoam, Cups 12 oz Dart/Solo = 100 cups 20250010 $ 1.25 Dart 00427  $ 5.25 WinCup 116964 $ 25.60
5  Styrofoam, Cups 16 oz. Dart/Solo = 480 cups 20250012  $ 1.55 Dart 00426 $ 5.25 WinCup 116965 $ 17.00
Group IV Total: $  10.63 $ 23.75 $ 42.60
Delivery is guaranteed not later than __days after order
date. 5 days 5 days 3 days
Indicate the distance in miles from the County where
the service facility is located: 10 miles 0 miles 5 miles
. . 2912 Commerce Square South 510 35th St North Birmingham 4600 East Lake Boulevard
Service location address: Irondale, Al 35210 Al 35222 Birmingham Al 35217
Required Forms
Notification of Intent to Respond YES YES YES
Bid Form YES YES YES
Experience Statement YES YES YES
Subcontractors List YES YES YES
Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES YES
Affidavit of Contractor YES YES YES
EEOC Form YES YES YES
Debarment Statement YES YES YES
Required Forms YES YES YES
PACA Forms YES YES YES
Addendum 2 YES YES YES
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Contact Information

1

DS Services of America dba Primo Water North American Water Way Distributing Company

2 3

Birmingham Coca-Cola Bottling Co.

1 DS Services of America Inc. dba Primo Water North America

2300 Windy Ridge Pkwy Ste 500N Atlanta, Georgia 30339 | Contact:Davorin Todorovac | Ph: 678-486-3503 Fax: 678-460-3665 |
Email: sjackson@primowater.com

2 Water Way Distributing Co.

510 35th Street North Birmingham, AL 35222 | Contact: Reid Deshazo | Ph: 205-326-8800 ; 1-800-239-4032 Fax: 205-326-6640 |
Email: rdeshazo@the waterway.com

3 Birmingham Coca-Cola Bottling Co.

4600 East Lake Blvd Birmingham AL 35217 | Contact: Landon Suco| Ph: 205-841-2653| Email: landonsuco@cchcu.com
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Actual Cost Analysis

ITB 49-21 "Bottled Water, Cups and Cooler Rental"
Ericka Andrew, Buyer

Email: andrewe@jccal.org

1 2
DS Services of America dba Primo
Water North American Water Way Distributing Company
Monthly Invoice Pricing $ 774 $ 5.10

Gallon Water/Cooler Rental Invoicing Cost Analysis

ltem

No.- Qty Description Mfg. Pricing Qty Description Mfg. Pricing
1 1 Distilled Water 5 gallons Crystal Springs $ 4.75 1 Distilled Water 5 gallons Water Way $ 5.10
Monthly Cooler Rental
Monthly Cooler Rental (Standard Nexus or similar top (Standard Sized Capable of Hot/Cold
Sized Capable of Holding 5 load coolers Holding 5 gallons Water Primo/Brio - No

2 1 gallons Water Container) 3 2.99 1 Container) Charge $ -



